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Governor Signs 5 Bills Relating to Energy 
 
HONOLULU – Gov. Neil Abercrombie today signed five energy-related measures (Acts 106 to 
110) that address solar energy device warranties or guarantees, the energy systems 
development fund, the Public Utilities Commission, modernization of the electric grid and a car-
sharing vehicle surcharge tax. 
 
“We spend billions of dollars a year on imported oil,” Gov. Abercrombie said. “Let’s keep our 
money within the state by investing in clean, renewable energy development that will reduce 
carbon emissions in the process, helping to mitigate climate change. These bills are critical to 
Hawaii’s future and demonstrate our commitment to a more sustainable state for our residents.”  
 
Senate Bill 2657 (Relating to Renewable Energy) requires contractors installing solar energy 
devices to notify private entities that installation may void roofing warranties or guarantees and 
to obtain written approval and follow written instructions for waterproofing roof penetrations from 
the roof manufacturer, unless the private entity forgoes the roofing warranty or guarantee. The 
measure also requires a roofing contractor that waterproofs roof penetrations related to the 
installation of a solar energy device to honor the roof warranty or guarantee. 
 
Senate Bill 2196 (Relating to Energy) reestablishes the energy systems development special 
fund that was repealed on June 30, 2013. The measure also extends the allocation of revenues 
collected from the environmental response, energy and food security tax, also known as the 
“barrel tax,” to various special funds from 2015 to 2030. 
  
Senate Bill 2948 (Relating to the Public Utilities Commission) transfers the administrative 
placement of the Commission from the Department of Budget and Finance to the Department of 
Commerce and Consumer Affairs and clarifies its authority to concerning standard 
administrative practices, including operational expenditures and hiring personnel. The measure 
also enables the commission chair to appoint, employ and dismiss an executive, fiscal and 
personnel officer. 
 
House Bill 1943 (Modernization of the Hawaii Electric System) amends the Public Utilities 
Commission principles regarding the modernization of the electric grid. 
 
Senate Bill 2731 (Relating to a Car-sharing Vehicle Surcharge Tax) establishes a car-
sharing vehicle surcharge tax. 
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